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(SAME 'ER SHARMA) 

SECTION OFFICER E-HI 

Directorate of Education,Delhi 

(Govt. of NCT of Delhi) 

E-III Branch,Old Sectt.Delhi 

Appointment Order 

Order No: DE.3(06)/E-III/DR/2018/  (.6.93 	 Posting ID: 20180060 

Date: 31/07/2018 

Consequent upon his/her selection on provisional basis through Delhi Subordinate Services Selection Board for recruitment to 
the Post of TGT SANSKRIT and with the prior approval of Competent Authority MR/MS. RAHUL KUMAR MISHRA (Employee 
ID= 20181821) is hereby appointed purely on provisional basis to the post of TGT SANSKRIT in the pay scale of Rs. 9300-
34800(4600)/-(Pre-revised) plus usual allowances as admissible under the rules from time to time subject to usual terms and 
conditions given in the offer of appointment and accepted by him/her. He/She is further directed to report to his/her place of 
posting latest by 21/08/2018 failing which his/her appointment shall stand cancelled without any further communication. 

Mr./Ms. RAHUL KUMAR MISHRA (Employee ID=20181821) is posted at Kitchner Road-SV-2026002 as TGT SANSKRIT. 

This appointment is temporary and on provisional basis for two years and further subject to verification of character and 
antecedents by the DDE concerned. He/She has been medically examined by the LOK NAYAK JAIPRAKASH HOSPITAL 
hospital and declared FIT vide their letter No. 32-10-G/CS/296 DATED 09/06/2018 

This appointment is also subject to authentication of documents of documents/certificates including caste and Physical Handicap 
certificate by the Concerned DDE from concerned Institutes/Universities/Authorities on joining the respective school. 

This issues with the concurrence of the Director of Education. 

(SAME SHARMA) 

SECTION OFFICER E-III 

Endorsement No DE.3(06)/E-III/DR/2018/ 

Copy forwarded to:- 

1. P.S. to Secy.,Education. 

2. P.S. to DE,Dte of Education. 

3. RD Concerned. 

4. DDE concerned with the direction to verify the eligibility of the candidate as per the provision of RRs and also to get the 
SC/ST/PH Certificate verified wherever applicable and send a status report to the undersigned within 90 days of issue of this 
order. 

5. E0 Concerned 

6. AO(Estt.)Concerned. 

7. AAO Concerned Accounts branch. 

8. PAO Concerned. 

9. HOS concerned. 

10. Incharge(Computer Cell),Dte. of Education. 

11. Employee Concerned-RAHUL KUMAR MISHRA-20181821 VILLAGE TUDIYAR, POST-CHIRAON, THESIL-KORAON, DISTT-
ALLAHABAD, U.P.-212306 

12. Guard File 



\\Or  

(SAME SHARMA) 

SECTION OFFICER E-III 

Directorate of Education,Delhi 

(Govt. of NCT of Delhi) 

E-III Branch,Old Sectt.Delhi 

Appointment Order 

Order No: DE.3(06)/E-III/DR/2018/ 
	

Posting ID: 20180060 

Date: 31/07/2018 

Consequent upon his/her selection on provisional basis through Delhi Subordinate Services Selection Board for recruitment to 
the Post of TGT SANSKRIT and with the prior approval of Competent Authority MR/MS. PRAHLAD JAT (Employee ID= 
20181820) is hereby appointed purely on provisional basis to the post of TGT SANSKRIT in the pay scale of Rs. 9300-
34800(4600)/-(Pre-revised) plus usual allowances as admissible under the rules from time to time subject to usual terms and 
conditions given in the offer of appointment and accepted by him/her. He/She is further directed to report to his/her place of 
posting latest by 21/08/2018 failing which his/her appointment shall stand cancelled without any further communication. 

Mr./Ms. PRAHLAD JAT (Employee ID=20181820) is posted at Rajouri Garden Extn.-GBSSS-1515006 as TGT SANSKRIT. 

This appointment is temporary and on provisional basis for two years and further subject to verification of character and 
antecedents by the DDE concerned. He/She has been medically examined by the LOK NAYAK JAIPRAKASH HOSPITAL 
hospital and declared FIT vide their letter No. 32-10-G/CS/296 DATED 09/06/2018 

This appointment is also subject to authentication of documents of documents/certificates including caste and Physical Handicap 
certificate by the Concerned DDE from concerned Institutes/Universities/Authorities on joining the respective school. 

This issues with the concurrence of the Director of Education. 

Endorsement No DE.3(06)/E-III/DR/2018/ 

Copy forwarded to:- 

1. P.S. to Secy.,Education. 

2. P.S. to DE,Dte of Education. 

3. RD Concerned. 

4. DDE concerned with the direction to verify the eligibility of the candidate as per the provision of RRs and also to get the 
SC/ST/PH Certificate verified wherever applicable and send a status report to the undersigned within 90 days of issue of this 
order. 

5. EO Concerned 

6. AO(Estt.)Concerned. 

7. AAO Concerned Accounts branch. 

8. PAO Concerned. 

9. HOS concerned. 

10. Incharge(Computer Cell),Dte. of Education. 

11. Employee Concerned-PRAHLAD JAT-20181820 VILLAGE SAJANPARA, POST JAHARU, TEHSIL KATHUMAR DISTT-ALWAR, 
RAJSTHAN-301035 

12. Guard File 

(SAMEER SHARMA) 

SECTION OFFICER E-III 



Directorate of Education,Delhi 

(Govt. of NCT of Delhi) 

E-III Branch,Old Sectt.Delhi 

Appointment Order 

Order No: DE.3(06)/E-III/DR/2018/ 
(N) Posting ID: 20180060 

Date: 31/07/2018 

Consequent upon his/her selection on provisional basis through Delhi Subordinate Services Selection Board for recruitment to 
the Post of TGT SANSKRIT and with the prior approval of Competent Authority MR/MS. NAVNEET KAUSHIK (Employee ID= 
20181822) is hereby appointed purely on provisional basis to the post of TGT SANSKRIT in the pay scale of Rs. 9300-
34800(4600)/-(Pre-revised) plus usual allowances as admissible under the rules from time to time subject to usual terms and 
conditions given in the offer of appointment and accepted by him/her. He/She is further directed to report to his/her place of 
posting latest by 21/08/2018 failing which his/her appointment shall stand cancelled without any further communication. 

Mr./Ms. NAVNEET KAUSHIK (Employee ID=20181822) is posted at Shastri Nagar, Lalita Block - SBV-1208229 as TGT 
SANSKRIT. 

This appointment is temporary and on provisional basis for two years and further subject to verification of character and 
antecedents by the DDE concerned. He/She has been medically examined by the LOK NAYAK JAIPRAKASH HOSPITAL 
hospital and declared FIT vide their letter No. 32-10-G/CS/271 DATED 01/06/2018 

This appointment is also subject to authentication of documents of documents/certificates including caste and Physical Handicap 
certificate by the Concerned DDE from concerned Institutes/Universities/Authorities on joining the respective school. 

This issues with the concurrence of the Director of Education. 

(SAM ER SHARMA) 

SECTION OFFICER E-III 

Endorsement No DE.3(06)/E-III/DR/2018/ 

Copy forwarded to:- 

1. P.S. to Secy.,Education. 

2. P.S. to DE,Dte of Education. 

3. RD Concerned. 

4. DDE concerned with the direction to verify the eligibility of the candidate as per the provision of RRs and also to get the 
SC/ST/PH Certificate verified wherever applicable and send a status report to the undersigned within 90 days of issue of this 
order. 

5. EO Concerned 

6. AO(Estt.)Concerned. 

7. AAO Concerned Accounts branch. 

8. PAO Concerned. 

9. HOS concerned. 

10. Incharge(Computer Cell),Dte. of Education. 

11. Employee Concerned-NAVNEET KAUSHIK-20181822 G-142,BLOCK-G,VIJAY VIHAR PHASE-2,DELHI 

12. Guard File 

(SAM ER SHARMA) 

SECTION OFFICER E-III 



This issues with the concurrence of the Director of Education. 

r>r 

(SAME R SHARMA) 

SECTION OFFICER E-III 

eiAr'r 

Directorate of Education,Delhi 

(Govt. of NCT of Delhi) 

E-III Branch,Old Sectt.Delhi 

Appointment Order 

Order No: DE.3(06)/E-III/DR/2018/ 
kN°  

Posting ID: 20180060 

Date: 31/07/2018 

Consequent upon his/her selection on provisional basis through Delhi Subordinate Services Selection Board for recruitment to 
the Post of TGT SANSKRIT and with the prior approval of Competent Authority MR/MS. MOHIT (Employee ID= 20181827) is 
hereby appointed purely on provisional basis to the post of TGT SANSKRIT in the pay scale of Rs. 9300-34800(4600)/-(Pre-
revised) plus usual allowances as admissible under the rules from time to time subject to usual terms and conditions given in 
the offer of appointment and accepted by him/her. He/She is further directed to report to his/her place of posting latest by 
21/08/2018 failing which his/her appointment shall stand cancelled without any further communication. 

Mr./Ms. MOHIT (Employee ID=20181827) is posted at Shastri Nagar, Lalita Block - SBV-1208229 as TGT SANSKRIT. 

This appointment is temporary and on provisional basis for two years and further subject to verification of character and 
antecedents by the DDE concerned. He/She has been medically examined by the LOK NAYAK JAIPRAKASH HOSPITAL 
hospital and declared FIT vide their letter No. 32-10-G/CS/244 DATED 23/05/2018 

This appointment is also subject to authentication of documents of documents/certificates including caste and Physical Handicap 
certificate by the Concerned DDE from concerned Institutes/Universities/Authorities on joining the respective school. 

Endorsement No DE.3(06)/E-III/DR/2018/ 

Copy forwarded to:- 

1. P.S. to Secy.,Education. 

2. P.S. to DE,Dte of Education. 

3. RD Concerned. 

4. DDE concerned with the direction to verify the eligibility of the candidate as per the provision of RRs and also to get the 
SC/ST/PH Certificate verified wherever applicable and send a status report to the undersigned within 90 days of issue of this 
order. 

5. EC Concerned 

6. AO(Estt.)Concerned. 

7. AAO Concerned Accounts branch. 

8. PAO Concerned. 

9. HOS concerned. 

10. Incharge(Computer Cell),Dte. of Education. 

11. Employee Concerned-MOHIT -20181827 VPO-THOI,THESIL-SHRIMADHOPUR,DISTT-SIKAR, RAJASTHAN-332719 

12. Guard File 

(SAM ER SHARMA) 

SECTION OFFICER E-III 



\f)r  
(SA ER SHARMA) 

SECTION OFFICER E-III 

Directorate of Education,Delhi 

(Govt. of NCT of Delhi) 

E-III Branch,Old Sectt.Delhi 

Appointment Order 

Order No: DE.3(06)/E-III/DR/2018/ (It/ Posting ID: 20180060 

Date: 31/07/2018 

Consequent upon his/her selection on provisional basis through Delhi Subordinate Services Selection Board for recruitment to 
the Post of TGT SANSKRIT and with the prior approval of Competent Authority MR/MS. ANKITA MISHRA (Employee ID= 
20181829) is hereby appointed purely on provisional basis to the post of TGT SANSKRIT in the pay scale of Rs. 9300-
34800(4600)/-(Pre-revised) plus usual allowances as admissible under the rules from time to time subject to usual terms and 
conditions given in the offer of appointment and accepted by him/her. He/She is further directed to report to his/her place of 
posting latest by 21/08/2018 failing which his/her appointment shall stand cancelled without any further communication. 

Mr./Ms. ANKITA MISHRA (Employee ID=20181829) is posted at Geeta Colony, Block 2-G(Co-ed)SS-1003202 as TGT 
SANSKRIT. 

This appointment is temporary and on provisional basis for two years and further subject to verification of character and 
antecedents by the DDE concerned. The above named candidate has sought exemption from medical examination by virtue of 
the candidate being in Govt. Service on the basis of documents provided by the concerned candidate or the candidate's 
administrative office. 

This appointment is also subject to authentication of documents of documents/certificates including caste and Physical Handicap 
certificate by the Concerned DDE from concerned Institutes/Universities/Authorities on joining the respective school. 

This issues with the concurrence of the Director of Education. 

(SAME R SHARMA) 

SECTION OFFICER E-III 

Endorsement No DE.3(06)/E-III/DR/2018/ 

Copy forwarded to:- 

1. P.S. to Secy.,Education. 

2. P.S. to DE,Dte of Education. 

3. RD Concerned. 

4. DDE concerned with the direction to verify the eligibility of the candidate as per the provision of RRs and also to get the 
SC/ST/PH Certificate verified wherever applicable and send a status report to the undersigned within 90 days of issue of this 
order. 

5. EO Concerned 

6. AO(Estt.)Concerned. 

7. AAO Concerned Accounts branch. 

8. PAO Concerned. 

9. HOS concerned. 

10. Incharge(Computer Cell),Dte. of Education. 

11. Employee Concerned-ANKITA MISHRA-20181829 A10/37K,PRAHLADGHAT,VARANASI U.P.-221001 

12. Guard File 



(SAMRER SHARMA) 

SECTION OFFICER E-III 

q )r  

Directorate of Education,Delhi 

(Govt. of NCT of Delhi) 

E-III Branch,Old Sectt.Delhi 

Appointment Order 

Order No: DE.3(06)/E-III/DR/2018/ 	4/§ 	 Posting ID: 20180060 

Date: 31/07/2018 

Consequent upon his/her selection on provisional basis through Delhi Subordinate Services Selection Board for recruitment to 
the Post of TGT SANSKRIT and with the prior approval of Competent Authority MR/MS. AMIT KUMAR (Employee ID= 
20181824) is hereby appointed purely on provisional basis to the post of TGT SANSKRIT in the pay scale of Rs. 9300-
34800(4600)/-(Pre-revised) plus usual allowances as admissible under the rules from time to time subject to usual terms and 
conditions given in the offer of appointment and accepted by him/her. He/She is further directed to report to his/her place of 
posting latest by 21/08/2018 failing which his/her appointment shall stand cancelled without any further communication. 

Mr./Ms. AMIT KUMAR (Employee ID=20181824) is posted at Khera Khurd-GBSSS-1310015 as TGT SANSKRIT. 

This appointment is temporary and on provisional basis for two years and further subject to verification of character and 
antecedents by the DDE concerned. He/She has been medically examined by the LOK NAYAK JAIPRAKASH HOSPITAL 
hospital and declared FIT vide their letter No. 32-10-G/CS/244 DATED 23/05/2018 

This appointment is also subject to authentication of documents of documents/certificates including caste and Physical Handicap 
certificate by the Concerned DDE from concerned Institutes/Universities/Authorities on joining the respective school. 

This issues with the concurrence of the Director of Education. 

Endorsement No DE.3(06)/E-III/DR/2018/ 

Copy forwarded to:- 

1. P.S. to Secy.,Education. 

2. P.S. to DE,Dte of Education. 

3. RD Concerned. 

4. DDE concerned with the direction to verify the eligibility of the candidate as per the provision of RRs and also to get the 
SC/ST/PH Certificate verified wherever applicable and send a status report to the undersigned within 90 days of issue of this 
order. 

5. E0 Concerned 

6. AO(Estt.)Concerned. 

7. AAO Concerned Accounts branch. 

8. PAO Concerned. 

9. HOS concerned. 

10. Incharge(Computer Cell),Dte. of Education. 

11. Employee Concerned-AMIT KUMAR-20181824 VPO-BAYANPUR, DISTT-SONEPAT,HARYANA-131001 

12. Guard File 

r>r 

(SAM ER SHARMA) 

SECTION OFFICER E-III 



Directorate of Education,Delhi 

(Govt. of NCT of Delhi) 

E-III Branch,Old Sectt.Delhi 

Appointment Order 

Order No: DE.3(06)/E-III/DR/2018/ 
	

Posting ID: 20180060 

Date: 31/07/2018 

Consequent upon his/her selection on provisional basis through Delhi Subordinate Services Selection Board for recruitment to 
the Post of TGT SANSKRIT and with the prior approval of Competent Authority MR/MS. ALOK KUMAR DUBEY (Employee ID= 
20181823) is hereby appointed purely on provisional basis to the post of TGT SANSKRIT in the pay scale of Rs. 9300-
34800(4600)/-(Pre-revised) plus usual allowances as admissible under the rules from time to time subject to usual terms and 
conditions given in the offer of appointment and accepted by him/her. He/She is further directed to report to his/her place of 
posting latest by 21/08/2018 failing which his/her appointment shall stand cancelled without any further communication. 

Mr./Ms. ALOK KUMAR DUBEY (Employee ID=20181823) is posted at Mangolpuri, Plot II,Kamdhenu- SBV-1412013 as 
TGT SANSKRIT. 

This appointment is temporary and on provisional basis for two years and further subject to verification of character and 
antecedents by the DDE concerned. He/She has been medically examined by the LOK NAYAK JAIPRAKASH HOSPITAL 
hospital and declared FIT vide their letter No. 32-10-G/CS/258 DATED 26/05/2018 

This appointment is also subject to authentication of documents of documents/certificates including caste and Physical Handicap 
certificate by the Concerned DDE from concerned Institutes/Universities/Authorities on joining the respective school. 

This issues with the concurrence of the Director of Education. 

• 
(SAM; / R SHARMA) 

SECTION OFFICER E-III 

Endorsement No DE.3(06)/E-III/DR/2018/ 

Copy forwarded to:- 

1. P.S. to Secy.,Education. 

2. P.S. to DE,Dte of Education 

3. RD Concerned. 

4. DDE concerned with the direction to verify the eligibility of the candidate as per the provision of RRs and also to get the 
SC/ST/PH Certificate verified wherever applicable and send a status report to the undersigned within 90 days of issue of this 
order. 

5. EO Concerned 

6. AO(Estt.)Concerned. 

7. AAO Concerned Accounts branch. 

8. PAO Concerned. 

9. HOS concerned. 

10. Incharge(Computer Cell),Dte. of Education. 

11. Employee Concerned-ALOK KUMAR DUBEY-20181823 B-93/3, RAJIV NAGAR BEGUMPUR OPP-ROHINI SECTOR-22 

12. Guard File 

(SAMEN.lC SHARMA) 

SECTION OFFICER E-III 



Directorate of Education,Delhi 

(Govt. of NCT of Delhi) 

E-III Branch,Old Sectt.Delhi 

Appointment Order 

Order No: DE.3(06)/E-III/DR/2018/  t  4i 	 Posting ID: 20180060 

Date: 31/07/2018 

Consequent upon his/her selection on provisional basis through Delhi Subordinate Services Selection Board for recruitment to 
the Post of TGT SANSKRIT and with the prior approval of Competent Authority MR/MS. ABHAY KUMAR DIXIT (Employee ID= 
20181828) is hereby appointed purely on provisional basis to the post of TGT SANSKRIT in the pay scale of Rs. 9300-
34800(4600)/-(Pre-revised) plus usual allowances as admissible under the rules from time to time subject to usual terms and 
conditions given in the offer of appointment and accepted by him/her. He/She is further directed to report to his/her place of 
posting latest by 21/08/2018 failing which his/her appointment shall stand cancelled without any further communication. 

Mr./Ms. ABHAY KUMAR DIXIT (Employee ID=20181828) is posted at Karampura, Block H- G(Co-ed) Sarvodaya 
Vidyalaya-1516104 as TGT SANSKRIT. 

This appointment is temporary and on provisional basis for two years and further subject to verification of character and 
antecedents by the DDE concerned. He/She has been medically examined by the LOK NAYAK JAIPRAKASH HOSPITAL 
hospital and declared FIT vide their letter No. 32-10-G/CS/244 DATED 23/05/2018 

This appointment is also subject to authentication of documents of documents/certificates including caste and Physical Handicap 
certificate by the Concerned DDE from concerned Institutes/Universities/Authorities on joining the respective school. 

This issues with the concurrence of the Director of Education. 

 

(SAMELyR SHARMA) 

SECTION OFFICER E-III 

Endorsement No DE.3(06)/E-III/DR/2018/ 

Copy forwarded to:- 

1. P.S. to Secy.,Education. 

2. P.S. to DE,Dte of Education. 

3. RD Concerned. 

4. DDE concerned with the direction to verify the eligibility of the candidate as per the provision of RRs and also to get the 
SC/ST/PH Certificate verified wherever applicable and send a status report to the undersigned within 90 days of issue of this 
order. 

5. EO Concerned 

6. AO(Estt.)Concerned. 

7. AA0 Concerned Accounts branch. 

8. PAO Concerned. 

9. HOS concerned. 

10. Incharge(Computer Cell),Dte. of Education. 

11. Employee Concerned-ABHAY KUMAR DIXIT-20181828 P.NO-18,GANESH VIHAR-A,CHARAN NADI-II,NADI KA PHATAK, 
MURLIPURA, JAIPUR, RAJASTHAN-302039 

12. Guard File 

(SAM ER SHARMA) 

SECTION OFFICER E-III 



41,\\ 
(SA 	SHARMA) 

SECTION OFFICER E-III 

(SAMEEIk ARMA) 

SECTION OFFICER E-III 

Maw  

Directorate of Education,Delhi 

(Govt. of NCT of Delhi) 

E-III Branch,Old Sectt.Delhi 

Appointment Order 

Order No: DE.3(06)/E-III/DR/2018/ 
	

Posting ID: 20180060 

Date: 31/07/2018 

Consequent upon his/her selection on provisional basis through Delhi Subordinate Services Selection Board for recruitment to 
the Post of TGT SANSKRIT and with the prior approval of Competent Authority MR/MS. SUMIT KUMAR (Employee ID= 
20181825) is hereby appointed purely on provisional basis to the post of TGT SANSKRIT in the pay scale of Rs. 9300-
34800(4600)/-(Pre-revised) plus usual allowances as admissible under the rules from time to time subject to usual terms and 
conditions given in the offer of appointment and accepted by him/her. He/She is further directed to report to his/her place of 
posting latest by 21/08/2018 failing which his/her appointment shall stand cancelled without any further communication. 

Mr./Ms. SUMIT KUMAR (Employee ID=20181825) is posted at Bakkarwala-G(Co-ed)SSS-1617029 as TGT SANSKRIT. 

This appointment is temporary and on provisional basis for two years and further subject to verification of character and 
antecedents by the DDE concerned. He/She has been medically examined by the LOK NAYAK JAIPRAKASH HOSPITAL 
hospital and declared FIT vide their letter No. 32-10-G/CS/244 DATED 23/05/2018 

This appointment is also subject to authentication of documents of documents/certificates including caste and Physical Handicap 
certificate by the Concerned DDE from concerned Institutes/Universities/Authorities on joining the respective school. 

This issues with the concurrence of the Director of Education. 

Endorsement No DE.3(06)/E-III/DR/2018/ 

Copy forwarded to:- 

1. P.S. to Secy.,Education. 

2. P.S. to DE,Dte of Education. 

3. RD Concerned. 

4. DDE concerned with the direction to verify the eligibility of the candidate as per the provision of RRs and also to get the 
SC/ST/PH Certificate verified wherever applicable and send a status report to the undersigned within 90 days of issue of this 
order. 

5. EO Concerned 

6. AO(Estt.)Concerned. 

7. AAO Concerned Accounts branch. 

8. PAO Concerned. 

9. HOS concerned. 

10. Incharge(Computer Cell),Dte. of Education. 

11. Employee Concerned-SUMIT KUMAR-20181825 VPO-RINDHANA, TEHSIL GOHANA, DISTT-SONIPAT,HARYANA-131304 

12. Guard File 



Directorate of Education,Delhi 

(Govt. of NCT of Delhi) 

E-III Branch,Old Sectt.Delhi 

Appointment Order 

Order No: DE.3(06)/E-III/DR/2018/ 	ki  Posting ID: 20180060 

Date: 31/07/2018 

Consequent upon his/her selection on provisional basis through Delhi Subordinate Services Selection Board for recruitment to 
the Post of TGT SANSKRIT and with the prior approval of Competent Authority MR/MS. SAJJAN KUMAR (Employee ID= 
20181826) is hereby appointed purely on provisional basis to the post of TGT SANSKRIT in the pay scale of Rs. 9300-
34800(4600)/-(Pre-revised) plus usual allowances as admissible under the rules from time to time subject to usual terms and 
conditions given in the offer of appointment and accepted by him/her. He/She is further directed to report to his/her place of 
posting latest by 21/08/2018 failing which his/her appointment shall stand cancelled without any further communication. 

Mr./Ms. SAJJAN KUMAR (Employee ID=20181826) is posted at Geeta Colony, Block 2-G(Co-ed)SS-1003202 as TGT 
SANSKRIT. 

This appointment is temporary and on provisional basis for two years and further subject to verification of character and 
antecedents by the DDE concerned. He/She has been medically examined by the LOK NAYAK JAIPRAKASH HOSPITAL 
hospital and declared FIT vide their letter No. 32-10-G/CS/244 DATED 23/05/2018 

This appointment is also subject to authentication of documents of documents/certificates including caste and Physical Handicap 
certificate by the Concerned DDE from concerned Institutes/Universities/Authorities on joining the respective school. 

This issues with the concurrence of the Director of Education. 

 

(SAM ER SHARMA) 

SECTION OFFICER E-III 

Endorsement No DE.3(06)/E-III/DR/2018/ 

Copy forwarded to:- 

1. P.S. to Secy.,Education. 

2. P.S. to DE,Dte of Education. 

3. RD Concerned. 

4. DDE concerned with the direction to verify the eligibility of the candidate as per the provision of RRs and also to get the 
SC/ST/PH Certificate verified wherever applicable and send a status report to the undersigned within 90 days of issue of this 
order. 

5. EO Concerned 

6. AO(Estt.)Concerned. 

7. AAO Concerned Accounts branch. 

8. PAO Concerned. 

9. HOS concerned. 

10. Incharge(Computer Cell),Dte. of Education. 

11. Employee Concerned-SAJJAN KUMAR-20181826 VPO-GANGIASAR VIA-BISSAU DISTT-JHUNJHUNU,RAJASTHAN-331027 

12. Guard File 

(SAME 'ER SHARMA) 

SECTION OFFICER E-III 



(SAMEERSHARMA) 

Directorate of Education,Delhi 

(Govt. of NCT of Delhi) 

E-III Branch,Old Sectt.Delhi 

Appointment Order 

Order No: DE.3(06)/E-III/DR/2018/ 
	

Posting ID: 20180060 

Date: 31/07/2018 

Consequent upon his/her selection on provisional basis through Delhi Subordinate Services Selection Board for recruitment to 
the Post of TGT SANSKRIT and with the prior approval of Competent Authority MR/MS. RAJESH KUMAR KAPURIYA 
(Employee ID= 20181830) is hereby appointed purely on provisional basis to the post of TGT SANSKRIT in the pay scale of Rs. 
9300-34800(4600)/-(Pre-revised) plus usual allowances as admissible under the rules from time to time subject to usual 
terms and conditions given in the offer of appointment and accepted by him/her. He/She is further directed to report to his/her 
place of posting latest by 21/08/2018 failing which his/her appointment shall stand cancelled without any further 
communication. 

Mr./Ms. RAJESH KUMAR KAPURIYA (Employee ID=20181830) is posted at Tilak Nagar, No.1-SBV-1514005 as TGT 
SANSKRIT. 

This appointment is temporary and on provisional basis for two years and further subject to verification of character and 
antecedents by the DDE concerned. The above named candidate has sought exemption from medical examination by virtue of 
the candidate being in Govt. Service on the basis of documents provided by the concerned candidate or the candidate's 
administrative office. 

This appointment is also subject to authentication of documents of documents/certificates including caste and Physical Handicap 
certificate by the Concerned DDE from concerned Institutes/Universities/Authorities on joining the respective school. 

This issues with the concurrence of the Director of Education. 

SECTION OFFICER E-III 

Endorsement No DE.3(06)/E-III/DR/2018/ 

Copy forwarded to:- 

1. P.S. to Secy.,Education. 

2. P.S. to DE,Dte of Education. 

3. RD Concerned. 

4. DDE concerned with the direction to verify the eligibility of the candidate as per the provision of RRs and also to get the 
SC/ST/PH Certificate verified wherever applicable and send a status report to the undersigned within 90 days of issue of this 
order. 

5. EO Concerned 

6. AO(Estt.)Concerned. 

7. AAO Concerned Accounts branch. 

8. PAO Concerned. 

9. HOS concerned. 

10. Incharge(Computer Cell),Dte. of Education. 

11. Employee Concerned-RAJESH KUMAR KAPURIYA-20181830 VPO-KHORALADKHANI, VIA-GATHWARI, THESIL-SHAHPURA, 
DISTT-JAIPUR, RAJASTHAN 

12. Guard File 

(SAM ER SHARMA) 

SECTION OFFICER E-III 


